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Ally Durrington is not having a good year. She has broken up with her girlfriend, she hates her job and she
feels like life is passing her by without fulfilling her dreams. After her break-up, Ally decides to actively
change her life. Ally gives in her resignation, moves back to her home town and starts over. The trouble is,
beginning again at thirty years old is harder than she ever imagined. Ally is all set to give up when she meets
and falls heavily for a woman called Alex. Alex is a successful woman with her own business and despite
some reservations, agrees to take Ally on. Ally sets up an art gallery in one of the buildings surrounding
Alex’s café and immediately sets about making a go of her new business. Alex is older and already attached
to another woman so Ally worries her feelings are one sided. When a Christmas kiss changes everything
between them, Ally must decide whether to pursue a relationship with someone who is already taken or
ignore her feelings and move on. As Alex’s circumstances change, Ally finds herself once again thrown into
her arms. Will Ally and Alex find their happy ending? Find out in...A Christmas kiss. A story of family,
changing your life journey for the better and falling in love…with a unique twist.
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From reader reviews:

Jimmy Hicks:

Now a day people who Living in the era wherever everything reachable by connect with the internet and the
resources inside can be true or not involve people to be aware of each information they get. How a lot more
to be smart in receiving any information nowadays? Of course the solution is reading a book. Reading
through a book can help individuals out of this uncertainty Information particularly this A Christmas Kiss
book because this book offers you rich details and knowledge. Of course the information in this book
hundred per cent guarantees there is no doubt in it you may already know.

Randall Yang:

Reading a e-book tends to be new life style in this era globalization. With looking at you can get a lot of
information that may give you benefit in your life. Along with book everyone in this world can easily share
their idea. Publications can also inspire a lot of people. A lot of author can inspire their particular reader with
their story or their experience. Not only situation that share in the ebooks. But also they write about the
ability about something that you need case in point. How to get the good score toefl, or how to teach your
kids, there are many kinds of book that exist now. The authors on earth always try to improve their expertise
in writing, they also doing some analysis before they write to the book. One of them is this A Christmas
Kiss.

Susan Williams:

Spent a free a chance to be fun activity to do! A lot of people spent their sparetime with their family, or their
own friends. Usually they undertaking activity like watching television, likely to beach, or picnic in the park.
They actually doing ditto every week. Do you feel it? Will you something different to fill your own personal
free time/ holiday? Can be reading a book could be option to fill your free of charge time/ holiday. The first
thing that you ask may be what kinds of publication that you should read. If you want to attempt look for
book, may be the guide untitled A Christmas Kiss can be very good book to read. May be it is usually best
activity to you.

James Shockley:

Why? Because this A Christmas Kiss is an unordinary book that the inside of the book waiting for you to
snap this but latter it will surprise you with the secret it inside. Reading this book next to it was fantastic
author who have write the book in such incredible way makes the content inside easier to understand,
entertaining approach but still convey the meaning totally. So , it is good for you for not hesitating having
this anymore or you going to regret it. This amazing book will give you a lot of advantages than the other
book have such as help improving your talent and your critical thinking approach. So , still want to hold off
having that book? If I were being you I will go to the e-book store hurriedly.
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