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or anyone who loves Paris and the mysterious allure of old houses, this charming, personal and informed
memoir makes for perfect reading. In a knowledgeable, literate style that conveys (and makes contagious)
Karmel's love of his subject, A Corner in the Marais traces the architectural and social development of the
City of Lights, from its origins as a Roman settlement, through major redevelopments brought about by
Henry IV and Baron Haussmann, through the recent, and sensitive, renovation and restoration of its old
neighborhoods.

The story begins with Karmel and his French wife fulfilling a long-standing dream: buying an apartment in
the Marais, Paris's celebrated historic district, the site of some of city's oldest and most picturesque buildings.
It soon becomes clear that their new home, which has witnessed six centuries of Parisian life, provides not
only a refuge but a fresh and lively vantage point from which to view the city's history, revealing information
that will surprise even the most confirmed Francophile.

The book concludes with a "walking tour" of Marais, in which the principal buildings are discussed with
brisk authority. Although Karmel takes pains to fill in historical lacunae from town records, he never loses
sight of the fascinating human details whether royal squabbles, commercial transactions, or family chicanery
that have played their role in shaping Paris as we now know it.

Illustrated with photographs and period engravings, A Corner in the Marais is ideal reading for anyone who
loves exploring the hidden byways of vieux Paris and experiencing history from a personal and singularly
engaging viewpoint.

"Karmel illuminates shadows of French history, architecture, even character and theater with a novelist's
knack for detail and an architect's eye for stories in stone."
The New York Times
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From reader reviews:

Kenneth Hand:

What do you with regards to book? It is not important together with you? Or just adding material when you
require something to explain what you problem? How about your free time? Or are you busy individual? If
you don't have spare time to accomplish others business, it is make one feel bored faster. And you have spare
time? What did you do? Everybody has many questions above. They must answer that question because just
their can do in which. It said that about publication. Book is familiar on every person. Yes, it is correct.
Because start from on jardín de infancia until university need this A Corner in the Marais: Memoir of a Paris
Neighborhood to read.

Fred Swett:

People live in this new time of lifestyle always try to and must have the free time or they will get wide range
of stress from both lifestyle and work. So , when we ask do people have extra time, we will say absolutely
yes. People is human not a robot. Then we ask again, what kind of activity have you got when the spare time
coming to you actually of course your answer will unlimited right. Then ever try this one, reading guides. It
can be your alternative within spending your spare time, the actual book you have read will be A Corner in
the Marais: Memoir of a Paris Neighborhood.

Kori Pierson:

Are you kind of active person, only have 10 or 15 minute in your morning to upgrading your mind
proficiency or thinking skill perhaps analytical thinking? Then you have problem with the book when
compared with can satisfy your short space of time to read it because all this time you only find book that
need more time to be examine. A Corner in the Marais: Memoir of a Paris Neighborhood can be your answer
since it can be read by you who have those short extra time problems.

Peter Beaton:

A lot of e-book has printed but it is unique. You can get it by world wide web on social media. You can
choose the most beneficial book for you, science, comedy, novel, or whatever by means of searching from it.
It is identified as of book A Corner in the Marais: Memoir of a Paris Neighborhood. You'll be able to your
knowledge by it. Without leaving behind the printed book, it could possibly add your knowledge and make a
person happier to read. It is most essential that, you must aware about publication. It can bring you from one
destination to other place.
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