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The sixth book in the Haunted Hearts series takes the reader to the Great River Road along the bayous of
south Louisiana and onto the streets of the French Quarter in New Orleans. The journey begins at the
abandoned Wakefield Plantation near Vacherie, Louisiana... Content with the direction her life takes… The
temptation to earn a sweet payday and collect enough money to start her own interior design business is too
much opportunity for Sophia Cannon to ignore, but working for her new client, Les Wakefield, is like
working for a creepy stalker. He seems to be everywhere she goes. Until trouble walks around the corner and
into her life again… Dylan Hunter almost turns down the Wakefield Manor restoration job until Les
Wakefield tells him Sophia is the interior designer hired to oversee furnishing the old plantation house.
Sophia has been the ghost in his life since the day she left him, haunting his heart with her memory every
day and every night. Stirring up more than just the spirits of the dead… Sophia and Dylan fight with each
other until a much bigger threat puts both their lives in danger. Discovering that generations of Wakefields
have restored the plantation only to disappear months after moving into the manor house stirs up spirits that
would rather remain undisturbed. Can love survive the long nights at Wakefield Manor with the
unmistakable scent of gardenias hanging so heavily in the air?
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From reader reviews:

Katherine Levy:

Reading can called brain hangout, why? Because if you find yourself reading a book mainly book entitled
The Unmistakable Scent of Gardenias (Haunted Hearts) (Volume 6) your thoughts will drift away trough
every dimension, wandering in most aspect that maybe not known for but surely will end up your mind
friends. Imaging each word written in a e-book then become one web form conclusion and explanation in
which maybe you never get prior to. The The Unmistakable Scent of Gardenias (Haunted Hearts) (Volume
6) giving you a different experience more than blown away your mind but also giving you useful information
for your better life within this era. So now let us explain to you the relaxing pattern is your body and mind
will be pleased when you are finished studying it, like winning a casino game. Do you want to try this
extraordinary paying spare time activity?

Brian Mejia:

Are you kind of hectic person, only have 10 or perhaps 15 minute in your time to upgrading your mind
expertise or thinking skill possibly analytical thinking? Then you have problem with the book as compared
to can satisfy your small amount of time to read it because this all time you only find reserve that need more
time to be study. The Unmistakable Scent of Gardenias (Haunted Hearts) (Volume 6) can be your answer
mainly because it can be read by an individual who have those short free time problems.

Melissa Ray:

Reserve is one of source of expertise. We can add our understanding from it. Not only for students but
additionally native or citizen require book to know the revise information of year to be able to year. As we
know those books have many advantages. Beside we add our knowledge, can also bring us to around the
world. By book The Unmistakable Scent of Gardenias (Haunted Hearts) (Volume 6) we can acquire more
advantage. Don't you to definitely be creative people? To become creative person must choose to read a
book. Merely choose the best book that suitable with your aim. Don't become doubt to change your life with
this book The Unmistakable Scent of Gardenias (Haunted Hearts) (Volume 6). You can more attractive than
now.

Jennifer Stanley:

A lot of people said that they feel bored when they reading a guide. They are directly felt the item when they
get a half areas of the book. You can choose often the book The Unmistakable Scent of Gardenias (Haunted
Hearts) (Volume 6) to make your own reading is interesting. Your personal skill of reading expertise is
developing when you similar to reading. Try to choose simple book to make you enjoy to learn it and mingle
the opinion about book and reading especially. It is to be first opinion for you to like to open a book and
learn it. Beside that the guide The Unmistakable Scent of Gardenias (Haunted Hearts) (Volume 6) can to be
your brand-new friend when you're experience alone and confuse using what must you're doing of the time.
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