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Over my dead body.

That's what I told Gracie when she informed me of her plan to pick some random guy she met online to get
rid of her pesky virginity.

If anyone is touching her, it's going to be me.

I shouldn't even be considering it, but I can't get it out of my head: her, under me, begging me.

***
Arrogant. Cocky. Prick.

Those are the words I'd use to describe my older brother's dangerously handsome best friend.

When he learned of my plan to kick off my white cotton briefs, ditching my good girl persona once and for
all by losing my virginity to the first eligible bachelor I could find, he flipped out. Said over his dead body.

He says if anyone's going to do it, it's going to be him.

I hate that I'm even considering his offer.

But I am ... I sooo am.

Ever since he suggested it, all I can think about is his cocky smile on those full lips as he's driving in to me.

But if we cross that line ... will I ever be able to go back?

MONSTER PRICK, a sexy romantic comedy, is a spin off novella from SCREWED, but can be read as a
standalone, as it features a new couple.
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From reader reviews:

Kimberly Franks:

Do you considered one of people who can't read gratifying if the sentence chained inside straightway, hold
on guys this specific aren't like that. This Monster Prick (An Older Brother's Best Friend Romance) book is
readable by you who hate the straight word style. You will find the data here are arrange for enjoyable
reading through experience without leaving also decrease the knowledge that want to supply to you. The
writer regarding Monster Prick (An Older Brother's Best Friend Romance) content conveys the idea easily to
understand by a lot of people. The printed and e-book are not different in the content but it just different such
as it. So , do you nonetheless thinking Monster Prick (An Older Brother's Best Friend Romance) is not
loveable to be your top collection reading book?

Katie Jones:

Often the book Monster Prick (An Older Brother's Best Friend Romance) will bring you to definitely the
new experience of reading a new book. The author style to elucidate the idea is very unique. Should you try
to find new book you just read, this book very acceptable to you. The book Monster Prick (An Older
Brother's Best Friend Romance) is much recommended to you to read. You can also get the e-book in the
official web site, so you can easier to read the book.

Maria Lamotte:

A lot of people always spent their very own free time to vacation or maybe go to the outside with them
family members or their friend. Were you aware? Many a lot of people spent many people free time just
watching TV, or playing video games all day long. If you want to try to find a new activity that's look
different you can read some sort of book. It is really fun to suit your needs. If you enjoy the book which you
read you can spent all day every day to reading a guide. The book Monster Prick (An Older Brother's Best
Friend Romance) it is very good to read. There are a lot of people who recommended this book. These were
enjoying reading this book. If you did not have enough space to bring this book you can buy often the e-
book. You can m0ore simply to read this book from the smart phone. The price is not too expensive but this
book offers high quality.

Kyle Reese:

The reason why? Because this Monster Prick (An Older Brother's Best Friend Romance) is an unordinary
book that the inside of the e-book waiting for you to snap the idea but latter it will distress you with the
secret this inside. Reading this book alongside it was fantastic author who have write the book in such
remarkable way makes the content on the inside easier to understand, entertaining means but still convey the
meaning entirely. So , it is good for you for not hesitating having this any more or you going to regret it. This
amazing book will give you a lot of advantages than the other book have got such as help improving your
skill and your critical thinking technique. So , still want to hold up having that book? If I were being you I



will go to the reserve store hurriedly.
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