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Written by a world-renowned theoretical physicist, Introduction to Statistical Physics, Second Edition
clarifies the properties of matter collectively in terms of the physical laws governing atomic motion. This
second edition expands upon the original to include many additional exercises and more pedagogically
oriented discussions that fully explain the concepts and applications.

The book first covers the classical ensembles of statistical mechanics and stochastic processes, including
Brownian motion, probability theory, and the Fokker–Planck and Langevin equations. To illustrate the use of
statistical methods beyond the theory of matter, the author discusses entropy in information theory,
Brownian motion in the stock market, and the Monte Carlo method in computer simulations. The next
several chapters emphasize the difference between quantum mechanics and classical mechanics—the
quantum phase. Applications covered include Fermi statistics and semiconductors and Bose statistics and
Bose–Einstein condensation. The book concludes with advanced topics, focusing on the Ginsburg–Landau
theory of the order parameter and the special kind of quantum order found in superfluidity and
superconductivity.

Assuming some background knowledge of classical and quantum physics, this textbook thoroughly
familiarizes advanced undergraduate students with the different aspects of statistical physics. This updated
edition continues to provide the tools needed to understand and work with random processes.
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From reader reviews:

Elmira McGraw:

The publication untitled Introduction to Statistical Physics, Second Edition is the publication that
recommended to you to study. You can see the quality of the publication content that will be shown to an
individual. The language that author use to explained their way of doing something is easily to understand.
The article writer was did a lot of exploration when write the book, and so the information that they share to
your account is absolutely accurate. You also can get the e-book of Introduction to Statistical Physics,
Second Edition from the publisher to make you far more enjoy free time.

Cheryl Phelps:

Reading a book to become new life style in this year; every people loves to go through a book. When you
read a book you can get a lot of benefit. When you read guides, you can improve your knowledge, mainly
because book has a lot of information into it. The information that you will get depend on what kinds of book
that you have read. If you need to get information about your research, you can read education books, but if
you want to entertain yourself you are able to a fiction books, such us novel, comics, and also soon. The
Introduction to Statistical Physics, Second Edition provide you with a new experience in examining a book.

Tracy Rendon:

As we know that book is significant thing to add our know-how for everything. By a e-book we can know
everything we wish. A book is a group of written, printed, illustrated or even blank sheet. Every year was
exactly added. This reserve Introduction to Statistical Physics, Second Edition was filled regarding science.
Spend your time to add your knowledge about your research competence. Some people has diverse feel when
they reading any book. If you know how big selling point of a book, you can really feel enjoy to read a book.
In the modern era like today, many ways to get book that you just wanted.

James Fox:

A lot of publication has printed but it is different. You can get it by web on social media. You can choose the
most effective book for you, science, witty, novel, or whatever through searching from it. It is referred to as
of book Introduction to Statistical Physics, Second Edition. You can add your knowledge by it. Without
departing the printed book, it may add your knowledge and make you actually happier to read. It is most
important that, you must aware about publication. It can bring you from one destination for a other place.
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