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Growth in the financial planning field has skyrocketed -- drawing professionals from accounting and
financial services to investment management. Now there is a book that addresses the needs of individuals
contemplating or beginning careers in financial planning. This book presents a blueprint for launching a
successful future in a lucrative, exciting profession.

Noted financial planning practitioner Jeffrey Rattiner covers everything aspiring and beginning planners
need to know. He takes the reader through the basics of what financial planners do and provides insight
about where the field is headed. Topics include education and certification requirements, options for
specialization, fee structures, logistics and technology, compliance, and legal issues. Rattiner also shows
planners the best methods for client prospecting and marketing, and lists helpful resources for ongoing
education.

This easy-to-use guide gives a direct, turnkey approach to entering the field and setting up a financial
planning practice. Special forms, checklists, and other useful tools reinforce the hands-on appeal of this
practical guide.
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From reader reviews:

Mary Todd:

Here thing why this kind of Getting Started as a Financial Planner are different and reputable to be yours.
First of all examining a book is good however it depends in the content than it which is the content is as
yummy as food or not. Getting Started as a Financial Planner giving you information deeper including
different ways, you can find any book out there but there is no publication that similar with Getting Started
as a Financial Planner. It gives you thrill studying journey, its open up your eyes about the thing that will
happened in the world which is probably can be happened around you. It is easy to bring everywhere like in
recreation area, café, or even in your approach home by train. Should you be having difficulties in bringing
the paper book maybe the form of Getting Started as a Financial Planner in e-book can be your alternative.

Agnes Figueroa:

Beside this particular Getting Started as a Financial Planner in your phone, it could possibly give you a way
to get nearer to the new knowledge or info. The information and the knowledge you may got here is fresh
from your oven so don't possibly be worry if you feel like an previous people live in narrow village. It is
good thing to have Getting Started as a Financial Planner because this book offers for your requirements
readable information. Do you often have book but you don't get what it's about. Oh come on, that wil happen
if you have this in the hand. The Enjoyable option here cannot be questionable, such as treasuring beautiful
island. Use you still want to miss it? Find this book and also read it from right now!

Darrell Mayo:

With this era which is the greater individual or who has ability to do something more are more important
than other. Do you want to become one of it? It is just simple approach to have that. What you are related is
just spending your time very little but quite enough to get a look at some books. Among the books in the top
collection in your reading list is usually Getting Started as a Financial Planner. This book that is certainly
qualified as The Hungry Hills can get you closer in getting precious person. By looking right up and review
this publication you can get many advantages.

Hilary Winters:

A number of people said that they feel weary when they reading a e-book. They are directly felt the item
when they get a half elements of the book. You can choose the particular book Getting Started as a Financial
Planner to make your reading is interesting. Your current skill of reading expertise is developing when you
like reading. Try to choose easy book to make you enjoy you just read it and mingle the idea about book and
studying especially. It is to be first opinion for you to like to wide open a book and go through it. Beside that
the book Getting Started as a Financial Planner can to be your friend when you're feel alone and confuse
using what must you're doing of these time.
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