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Produced in association with the Ramblers, this walking guide covers the popular Yorkshire Dales area and
combines detailed route descriptions with information on the local history and wildlife. The magnificent
Yorkshire Dales include impressive limestone formations, beautiful waterfalls, and shadowy peaks.
Picturesque dales such as Swaledale, Wharfedale, and Dentdale meander through the area, where abbey
ruins, ancient farmhouses, and villages wait to be discovered. The introduction gives information about the
topography, geology, and history of the area and describes the flora and fauna inhabiting it.
The main section of the book comprises 30 walks, each one including a key illustrating principal features
such as level of difficulty and type of terrain, a route profile indicating altitude and distances as well as a fact
file summarizing useful information such as start and finish points, duration, safety advice, and points of
interest. Illustrated with color maps from the Ordnance Survey, each walk is then described in detail with
clear, easy-to-follow instructions. As well as route descriptions, the text gives the history of the main
landmarks along the way plus information on the natural history of the area and is accompanied by stunning
color photographs. This updated edition includes an overview map displaying starting points for the walks,
color codes indicating the level of difficulty, and a key to the symbols used in the text and on the route maps.
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From reader reviews:

Carla Ramirez:

As people who live in often the modest era should be update about what going on or facts even knowledge to
make them keep up with the era which can be always change and advance. Some of you maybe will update
themselves by looking at books. It is a good choice for you but the problems coming to you is you don't
know which one you should start with. This Yorkshire Dales: Guide to 30 of the Best Walking Routes
(Collins Ramblers Guides) is our recommendation to cause you to keep up with the world. Why, as this book
serves what you want and need in this era.

Shawn Jones:

A lot of people always spent their particular free time to vacation or even go to the outside with them
household or their friend. Do you realize? Many a lot of people spent they free time just watching TV, or
maybe playing video games all day long. In order to try to find a new activity that's look different you can
read the book. It is really fun in your case. If you enjoy the book which you read you can spent the whole day
to reading a publication. The book Yorkshire Dales: Guide to 30 of the Best Walking Routes (Collins
Ramblers Guides) it doesn't matter what good to read. There are a lot of individuals who recommended this
book. These folks were enjoying reading this book. When you did not have enough space to create this book
you can buy often the e-book. You can m0ore easily to read this book out of your smart phone. The price is
not very costly but this book features high quality.

Terrance Pitt:

The reason? Because this Yorkshire Dales: Guide to 30 of the Best Walking Routes (Collins Ramblers
Guides) is an unordinary book that the inside of the e-book waiting for you to snap the item but latter it will
jolt you with the secret this inside. Reading this book next to it was fantastic author who have write the book
in such wonderful way makes the content within easier to understand, entertaining technique but still convey
the meaning fully. So , it is good for you because of not hesitating having this anymore or you going to regret
it. This amazing book will give you a lot of positive aspects than the other book have got such as help
improving your proficiency and your critical thinking approach. So , still want to hesitate having that book?
If I have been you I will go to the book store hurriedly.

Jesse Williams:

You are able to spend your free time to see this book this publication. This Yorkshire Dales: Guide to 30 of
the Best Walking Routes (Collins Ramblers Guides) is simple to create you can read it in the area, in the
beach, train and soon. If you did not include much space to bring the actual printed book, you can buy often
the e-book. It is make you quicker to read it. You can save the particular book in your smart phone.
Consequently there are a lot of benefits that you will get when one buys this book.
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