
Principles of International Humanitarian Law
Jonathan Crowe, Kylie Weston-Scheuber

Click here if your download doesn"t start automatically

http://toolbook.site/go/read.php?id=1782545948
http://toolbook.site/go/read.php?id=1782545948
http://toolbook.site/go/read.php?id=1782545948


Principles of International Humanitarian Law

Jonathan Crowe, Kylie Weston-Scheuber

Principles of International Humanitarian Law Jonathan Crowe, Kylie Weston-Scheuber
This book provides a clear and concise explanation of the central principles of international humanitarian law
(or the law of armed conflict) while situating them in a broader philosophical, ethical and legal context.

The authors consider a range of wider issues relevant to international humanitarian law, including its ethical
foundations, relationship to other bodies of international law and contemporary modes of enforcement. This
helps to develop a richer context for understanding the law of war and a sound basis for examining the
changing nature of contemporary armed conflict. The book also discusses important recent decisions by
international courts and tribunals, tracks the historical development of humanitarian principles in warfare and
considers the legal position of states, individuals and non-state groups.

Principles of International Humanitarian Law is an important resource for students of international
humanitarian law and International law academics, as well as international humanitarian law practitioners.

Contents: Preface 1. The Concept of Armed Conflict 2. Sources of International Humanitarian Law 3.
Means and Methods of Warfare 4. Protection of Civilians 5. Protection of Combatants Hors de Combat 6.
Humanitarianism and Human Rights 7. Liability of States and Non-State Groups 8. Liability of Individuals
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From reader reviews:

Waldo Gates:

Exactly why? Because this Principles of International Humanitarian Law is an unordinary book that the
inside of the publication waiting for you to snap it but latter it will zap you with the secret this inside.
Reading this book beside it was fantastic author who also write the book in such incredible way makes the
content interior easier to understand, entertaining technique but still convey the meaning completely. So , it
is good for you because of not hesitating having this any more or you going to regret it. This phenomenal
book will give you a lot of benefits than the other book possess such as help improving your ability and your
critical thinking approach. So , still want to hold up having that book? If I were being you I will go to the e-
book store hurriedly.

Dan Morris:

This Principles of International Humanitarian Law is great e-book for you because the content which is full
of information for you who always deal with world and have to make decision every minute. This specific
book reveal it data accurately using great organize word or we can say no rambling sentences inside it. So if
you are read that hurriedly you can have whole info in it. Doesn't mean it only will give you straight forward
sentences but tough core information with attractive delivering sentences. Having Principles of International
Humanitarian Law in your hand like obtaining the world in your arm, facts in it is not ridiculous 1. We can
say that no book that offer you world within ten or fifteen tiny right but this e-book already do that. So , this
is certainly good reading book. Heya Mr. and Mrs. hectic do you still doubt which?

William Wood:

Reading a book to get new life style in this yr; every people loves to examine a book. When you read a book
you can get a large amount of benefit. When you read books, you can improve your knowledge, because
book has a lot of information into it. The information that you will get depend on what types of book that
you have read. If you wish to get information about your examine, you can read education books, but if you
want to entertain yourself read a fiction books, these kinds of us novel, comics, and also soon. The Principles
of International Humanitarian Law will give you new experience in reading through a book.

Ann Amos:

Do you like reading a e-book? Confuse to looking for your selected book? Or your book was rare? Why so
many problem for the book? But almost any people feel that they enjoy for reading. Some people likes
studying, not only science book but in addition novel and Principles of International Humanitarian Law as
well as others sources were given information for you. After you know how the good a book, you feel desire
to read more and more. Science publication was created for teacher as well as students especially. Those
ebooks are helping them to add their knowledge. In additional case, beside science guide, any other book
likes Principles of International Humanitarian Law to make your spare time a lot more colorful. Many types



of book like here.
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