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The frustration and toil of common ACT prep materials is real--take a horribly boring test, review the
answers, cross your fingers you'll remember your mistake for next time. This is why Fun ACT Prep was
created! Now in the 2nd edition! Enjoy what you read while preparing for the ACT! "Fun ACT Prep English
and Reading: Skill by Skill" combines fun, high-interest topics relevant to teens with challenging passages
and standardized questions that mimic the ACT format. Practice for the ACT while reading about Batman,
LeBron James, phobias, video games, urban legends, "The Hunger Games," Taylor Swift, and many more!
This unique approach to learning each skill in isolation has been applauded by teachers and appreciated by
students. First, learn one of 23 critical English or Reading skills one at a time by learning all about the skill,
what the questions look like, and tips for conquering that type of question. This is done in a easy-to-
understand way. Then take a short formative assessment (quiz) using ONLY that skill with teen-friendly
subject matter. Self-check, reflect on what was learned, and learn some overall test tips along the way.
Chunk several skills together in a easy-to-read, full-length passage incorporating only 2-5 skills at a time.
Finally, combine all learned skills together in a final assessment. Isolating and chunking skills together is
proven method to make learning more manageable and easier to process. Useful for individual practice,
classroom instruction, or small group tutoring, "Fun ACT Prep English and Reading: Skill by Skill" is
adaptable for differentiated instruction and a Response to Invervention (RTI). Aligned to Common Core
Standards for Reading and Language Arts.
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From reader reviews:

Ana Steadman:

The book Fun ACT Prep English and Reading: Skill by Skill: because test prep doesn't have to be boring can
give more knowledge and information about everything you want. Why must we leave the best thing like a
book Fun ACT Prep English and Reading: Skill by Skill: because test prep doesn't have to be boring? A few
of you have a different opinion about reserve. But one aim in which book can give many data for us. It is
absolutely right. Right now, try to closer along with your book. Knowledge or information that you take for
that, it is possible to give for each other; you can share all of these. Book Fun ACT Prep English and
Reading: Skill by Skill: because test prep doesn't have to be boring has simple shape but you know: it has
great and large function for you. You can look the enormous world by wide open and read a book. So it is
very wonderful.

Dale Hollander:

Nowadays reading books are more than want or need but also work as a life style. This reading addiction
give you lot of advantages. Advantages you got of course the knowledge the actual information inside the
book in which improve your knowledge and information. The details you get based on what kind of book
you read, if you want get more knowledge just go with schooling books but if you want sense happy read one
with theme for entertaining for example comic or novel. Typically the Fun ACT Prep English and Reading:
Skill by Skill: because test prep doesn't have to be boring is kind of guide which is giving the reader
unpredictable experience.

Scott Anderson:

Reading a book to get new life style in this calendar year; every people loves to learn a book. When you go
through a book you can get a lot of benefit. When you read guides, you can improve your knowledge, due to
the fact book has a lot of information on it. The information that you will get depend on what sorts of book
that you have read. If you need to get information about your research, you can read education books, but if
you act like you want to entertain yourself you are able to a fiction books, this kind of us novel, comics, and
also soon. The Fun ACT Prep English and Reading: Skill by Skill: because test prep doesn't have to be
boring provide you with a new experience in reading a book.

Carmen Hamm:

Guide is one of source of understanding. We can add our knowledge from it. Not only for students but also
native or citizen require book to know the upgrade information of year for you to year. As we know those
textbooks have many advantages. Beside most of us add our knowledge, may also bring us to around the
world. By book Fun ACT Prep English and Reading: Skill by Skill: because test prep doesn't have to be
boring we can acquire more advantage. Don't you to definitely be creative people? For being creative person
must like to read a book. Merely choose the best book that suitable with your aim. Don't be doubt to change



your life by this book Fun ACT Prep English and Reading: Skill by Skill: because test prep doesn't have to
be boring. You can more inviting than now.
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