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20 Steamy Bonus Stories Included!

A Standalone Short Story with No Cliffhanger!

When twenty-six year old Contessa James wins big in the California Lottery, her life changes in ways she
never imagined. Desperate to get out of her crime-ridden neighborhood and away from people claiming to be
long-lost relatives in hopes of claiming a piece of her winnings, she moves to a wealthy community to escape
it all.

Then she meets a handsome man putting in an honest day’s work at a local horse show, she decides to hide
her fortune from him, hoping that he will like because of who she is, not what she has. But the mysterious
Mike Taylor has secrets of his own.

When the truth comes out, Tessa is shocked, scared, terrified and excited.

++ 20 Special Bonus Stories INCLUDED! ++
When you download this book, you will also get 20 steamy bonus books ABSOLUTELY FREE!

READ FREE with KINDLE UNLIMITED

Scroll up and click the orange buy now button to start reading TODAY...

WARNING: It contains mature language and content, intended for 18+ readers only!
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From reader reviews:

Charles Smith:

In this 21st one hundred year, people become competitive in each way. By being competitive currently,
people have do something to make all of them survives, being in the middle of the particular crowded place
and notice by means of surrounding. One thing that sometimes many people have underestimated it for a
while is reading. That's why, by reading a e-book your ability to survive boost then having chance to stand
up than other is high. For yourself who want to start reading a book, we give you this kind of BWWM
Romance: Her Dream Come True (Multicultural Interracial Alpha Billionaire BWWM Romance)
(Contemporary Second Chance African American Urban Hood Romance Short Stories) book as starter and
daily reading publication. Why, because this book is more than just a book.

David Carter:

Nowadays reading books become more and more than want or need but also get a life style. This reading
behavior give you lot of advantages. Associate programs you got of course the knowledge your information
inside the book this improve your knowledge and information. The details you get based on what kind of
book you read, if you want send more knowledge just go with training books but if you want truly feel happy
read one having theme for entertaining including comic or novel. Often the BWWM Romance: Her Dream
Come True (Multicultural Interracial Alpha Billionaire BWWM Romance) (Contemporary Second Chance
African American Urban Hood Romance Short Stories) is kind of e-book which is giving the reader
unpredictable experience.

Thomas Hill:

A lot of people always spent all their free time to vacation or perhaps go to the outside with them household
or their friend. Do you realize? Many a lot of people spent many people free time just watching TV, or
perhaps playing video games all day long. If you would like try to find a new activity here is look different
you can read some sort of book. It is really fun for you personally. If you enjoy the book which you read you
can spent 24 hours a day to reading a guide. The book BWWM Romance: Her Dream Come True
(Multicultural Interracial Alpha Billionaire BWWM Romance) (Contemporary Second Chance African
American Urban Hood Romance Short Stories) it is rather good to read. There are a lot of people that
recommended this book. These folks were enjoying reading this book. In case you did not have enough space
to create this book you can buy the particular e-book. You can m0ore simply to read this book from the smart
phone. The price is not very costly but this book possesses high quality.

Phyllis Granger:

This BWWM Romance: Her Dream Come True (Multicultural Interracial Alpha Billionaire BWWM
Romance) (Contemporary Second Chance African American Urban Hood Romance Short Stories) is great



publication for you because the content and that is full of information for you who have always deal with
world and still have to make decision every minute. That book reveal it data accurately using great plan word
or we can declare no rambling sentences within it. So if you are read this hurriedly you can have whole facts
in it. Doesn't mean it only offers you straight forward sentences but challenging core information with
splendid delivering sentences. Having BWWM Romance: Her Dream Come True (Multicultural Interracial
Alpha Billionaire BWWM Romance) (Contemporary Second Chance African American Urban Hood
Romance Short Stories) in your hand like finding the world in your arm, data in it is not ridiculous one
particular. We can say that no e-book that offer you world in ten or fifteen small right but this book already
do that. So , this is certainly good reading book. Heya Mr. and Mrs. hectic do you still doubt this?
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