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Although Americans generally think that the U.S. Department of Homeland Security is focused only on
preventing terrorism, one office within that agency has a humanitarian mission. Its Asylum Office
adjudicates applications from people fleeing persecution in their homelands. Lives in the Balance is a careful
empirical analysis of how Homeland Security decided these asylum cases over a recent fourteen-year period.
 
Day in and day out, asylum officers make decisions with life-or-death consequences: determining which
applicants are telling the truth and are at risk of persecution in their home countries, and which are ineligible
for refugee status in America. In Lives in the Balance, the authors analyze a database of 383,000 cases
provided to them by the government in order to better understand the effect on grant rates of a host of factors
unrelated to the merits of asylum claims, including the one-year filing deadline, whether applicants entered
the United States with a visa, whether applicants had dependents, whether they were represented, how many
asylum cases their adjudicator had previously decided, and whether or not their adjudicator was a lawyer.
The authors also examine the degree to which decisions were consistent among the eight regional asylum
offices and within each of those offices. The authors’ recommendations, including repeal of the one-year
deadline, would improve the adjudication process by reducing the impact of non-merits factors on asylum
decisions. If adopted by the government, these proposals would improve the accuracy of outcomes for those
whose lives hang in the balance.
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From reader reviews:

Ernest Villa:

In this 21st one hundred year, people become competitive in every way. By being competitive now, people
have do something to make all of them survives, being in the middle of the actual crowded place and notice
simply by surrounding. One thing that occasionally many people have underestimated that for a while is
reading. Yep, by reading a guide your ability to survive improve then having chance to stand than other is
high. For yourself who want to start reading some sort of book, we give you this kind of Lives in the
Balance: Asylum Adjudication by the Department of Homeland Security book as beginner and daily reading
guide. Why, because this book is more than just a book.

Jessica Garcia:

Do you have something that you want such as book? The book lovers usually prefer to opt for book like
comic, small story and the biggest the first is novel. Now, why not trying Lives in the Balance: Asylum
Adjudication by the Department of Homeland Security that give your fun preference will be satisfied simply
by reading this book. Reading routine all over the world can be said as the means for people to know world
far better then how they react in the direction of the world. It can't be said constantly that reading behavior
only for the geeky person but for all of you who wants to become success person. So , for all you who want
to start studying as your good habit, you can pick Lives in the Balance: Asylum Adjudication by the
Department of Homeland Security become your own starter.

Ruth Santiago:

As we know that book is important thing to add our information for everything. By a reserve we can know
everything we wish. A book is a pair of written, printed, illustrated or perhaps blank sheet. Every year was
exactly added. This reserve Lives in the Balance: Asylum Adjudication by the Department of Homeland
Security was filled regarding science. Spend your spare time to add your knowledge about your research
competence. Some people has various feel when they reading a new book. If you know how big benefit of a
book, you can truly feel enjoy to read a reserve. In the modern era like now, many ways to get book that you
wanted.

Steven Craig:

Reading a publication make you to get more knowledge from it. You can take knowledge and information
originating from a book. Book is created or printed or descriptive from each source this filled update of
news. In this modern era like today, many ways to get information are available for you actually. From
media social like newspaper, magazines, science book, encyclopedia, reference book, book and comic. You
can add your knowledge by that book. Isn't it time to spend your spare time to open your book? Or just in
search of the Lives in the Balance: Asylum Adjudication by the Department of Homeland Security when you
essential it?
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