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This is a cross-linguistic investigation of resumptive pronouns and related phenomena. Pronominal
resumption is the realization of the base of a syntactic dependency as a bound pronoun. Resumption occurs
in unbounded dependencies, such as relative clauses and questions, and in the variety of raising known as
copy raising. Processing factors may also give rise to resumption, even in environments where it does not
normally occur in a given language.

Ash Asudeh proposes a new theory of resumption based on the use of a resource logic for semantic
composition and the typologically robust observation that resumptive pronouns are ordinary pronouns in
their morphological and lexical properties. The framework for semantic composition is Glue Semantics and
the syntactic framework is Lexical-Functional Grammar. The author introduces these frameworks and the
concept of resource logics accessibly and compares results and explanations with those offered by a number
of contrasting theoretical frameworks.

The theory achieves a novel unification of hitherto heterogeneous resumption phenomena. It unifies two
kinds of resumptive pronouns that are found in unbounded dependencies - one kind behaves syntactically
like a gap, whereas the other kind does not. It also unifies resumptive pronouns in unbounded dependencies
with the obligatory pronouns in copy raising. The theory also provides the basis for a new understanding of
processing-based resumption, both in production and in parsing and interpretation.

This book makes a substantial contribution to the understanding of the syntax-semantics interface, the nature
of unbounded dependencies, and linguistic variation. It is clearly written and includes examples from a wide
range of languages, such as English, Hebrew, Irish, Swedish, and Vata. It will interest researchers in syntax
and semantics and its results are also relevant to computational linguistics, psycholinguistics, and the logical
analysis of language.
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From reader reviews:

Gertrude Call:

Do you have favorite book? When you have, what is your favorite's book? Book is very important thing for
us to understand everything in the world. Each e-book has different aim or goal; it means that e-book has
different type. Some people really feel enjoy to spend their the perfect time to read a book. They are really
reading whatever they take because their hobby is reading a book. Why not the person who don't like
examining a book? Sometime, man or woman feel need book whenever they found difficult problem or
exercise. Well, probably you will want this The Logic of Pronominal Resumption (Oxford Studies in
Theoretical Linguistics).

Sanjuana Day:

A lot of people always spent all their free time to vacation or perhaps go to the outside with them family or
their friend. Do you know? Many a lot of people spent they free time just watching TV, or even playing
video games all day long. If you want to try to find a new activity honestly, that is look different you can
read some sort of book. It is really fun for you personally. If you enjoy the book which you read you can
spent the entire day to reading a guide. The book The Logic of Pronominal Resumption (Oxford Studies in
Theoretical Linguistics) it is rather good to read. There are a lot of individuals who recommended this book.
These were enjoying reading this book. In case you did not have enough space to develop this book you can
buy often the e-book. You can m0ore very easily to read this book through your smart phone. The price is
not to fund but this book features high quality.

Danielle Tilley:

Many people spending their time period by playing outside using friends, fun activity using family or just
watching TV all day long. You can have new activity to enjoy your whole day by studying a book. Ugh, do
you consider reading a book can actually hard because you have to use the book everywhere? It okay you
can have the e-book, getting everywhere you want in your Smartphone. Like The Logic of Pronominal
Resumption (Oxford Studies in Theoretical Linguistics) which is obtaining the e-book version. So , why not
try out this book? Let's find.

William Black:

Don't be worry for anyone who is afraid that this book will probably filled the space in your house, you
might have it in e-book technique, more simple and reachable. This The Logic of Pronominal Resumption
(Oxford Studies in Theoretical Linguistics) can give you a lot of pals because by you investigating this one
book you have issue that they don't and make an individual more like an interesting person. That book can be
one of a step for you to get success. This reserve offer you information that probably your friend doesn't
understand, by knowing more than different make you to be great men and women. So , why hesitate? Let
me have The Logic of Pronominal Resumption (Oxford Studies in Theoretical Linguistics).
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